
 
MEMORANDUM 
To:  Liquor Commissioners 
 
From:  Tracey Covert, City Clerk 
 
Date:  March 9, 2012 
 
Re: Liquor Commission Hearing of March 13, 2012, located in the Council 

Chambers, 109 E. Olive St. 
 
 
4:00 p.m. Public Comment. 
 
  Request of Christopher J. Zimmerman to allow moderate consumption of alcohol 

at his June 2, 2012 wedding reception to be held at Davis Lodge on Lake 
Bloomington. 

 
  Request of Carly Dennis and Greg Varner to allow moderate consumption of 

alcohol at their December 1, 2012 wedding reception to be held at Miller Park 
Pavilion. 

 
  Hurley Enterprises, LLC, d/b/a Drifters, located at 612 N. Main currently holding 

a TAS liquor license which allows the sale of all types of alcohol by the glass for 
consumption on the premises seven (7) days a week had the corporate name 
rejected by the Secretary of State’s Office due to an existing corporation.  The 
liquor license for Hurley Consolidated Enterprises, LLC f/k/a Hurley Enterprises, 
LLC, remains in force. 

 
  Request from Big Bev, Inc., d/b/a Friar Tuck Beverage, located at 2401 Maloney 

Dr., currently holding a PAS liquor license which allows the sale of all types 
packaged alcohol for consumption off the premises seven (7) days a week to 
extend beer wine and spirit tastings from three (3) hours in length to four (4) 
hours per tasting. 

 
  The application of Arlandria, LCC, d/b/a Reality Bites, located at 414 N Main, 

currently holding an RAS liquor license which allows the sale of all types of 
alcohol by the glass for consumption on the premises seven (7) days a week, 
requesting an O (outdoor) addition to their liquor license. 



  Request from Pheasant Lanes Family Fun Center, LLC, d/b/a Pheasant Lanes & 
Kegler’s Pub, located at 804 N. Hershey Rd., requesting an RAS liquor license 
which allows the sale of all types of alcohol by the glass for consumption on the 
premises seven (7) days a week. 

 
 Request from Little India Bloomington & Normal, Inc., d/b/a Little India 

Restaurant, located at 503 N. Prospect Rd., Suite 103 – 104, requesting an RBS 
liquor license which would allow the sale of beer and wine only by the glass for 
consumption on the premises seven (7) days a week. 

 
  Initial Violation appearance of Peggy Ann Bateman, d/b/a Diggers Again!, 

located at 230 E. Front St., currently holding a TAS liquor license which allows 
the sale of all types of alcohol by the glass for consumption on the premises seven 
(7) days a week. 

 
Violation of MugShots Bar & Grill, LLC, d/b/a Mugshots Bar & Grill located at 
107 W. Front St., currently holding a TAS liquor license which allows the sale of 
all types of alcohol by the glass for consumption on the premises seven (7) days a 
week. 

 
 Violation of Road Stop Inc., d/b/a Road Stop located at 1513 Morrissey, currently 

holding a GPBS liquor license which allows the sale of packaged beer and wine 
for consumption off the premises seven (7) days a week. 

 
 Discussion of white papers. 
 
cc: Legal Dept. 
 
TC/rg 


