Y 3&&2}@/&4

ILLINOIS

AGENDA
BLOOMINGTON PROPERTY MAINTENANCE REVIEW BOARD
REGULAR MEETING - 4:00 P.M.
THURSDAY, JANUARY 23, 2020
COUNCIL CHAMBERS, CITY HALL
109 EAST OLIVE STREET
BLOOMINGTON, ILLINOIS

CALL TO ORDER
ROLL CALL
PUBLIC COMMENT

MINUTES:
Consideration, review and approval of Minutes from the April 25, 2019
Quarterly Meeting.

REGULAR AGENDA

A. Discussion on proposed adoption of the 2018 International Code Council
Property Maintenance Code and amendments to the Bloomington City Code
Chapter 45.

B. Discussion on the Neighborhood Preservation Ordinance for registering
derelict buildings and premises.

OLD BUSINESS
NEW BUSINESS

ADJOURNMENT

For further information contact:

Carey Snedden, Code Enforcement Division Manager
Department of Community Development
Government Center
115 E. Washington Street, Bloomington, IL 61701
Phone: (309) 434-2345 Fax: (309) 434-2801
E-mail: csnedden@cityblm.org



DRAFT MINUTES
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE REVIEW BOARD
Thursday, April 25, 2019, 4:00 P.M.
Council Chambers, City Hall
109 East Olive Street, Bloomington, Illinois

Members present: Mr. John Capodice, Mr. Mark Fetzer, Mr. Rodney Smithson,
Mr. Kelby Cumpston

Members absent: Mr. Robert Garcia

Also present: Mr. Carey Snedden, Code Enforcement Division Manager

1. CALL TO ORDER

Chairman Capodice called the meeting to order at 4:02 p.m.
2. ROLL CALL

Manager Snedden called roll and a quorum was established with four members present.
3. PUBLIC COMMENT

Chairman Capodice asked for public comment from the audience for those items that were not
listed on the meeting agenda. There were no public comments made.

4. MINUTES

A. Consideration, review and approval of Minutes from the January 24, 2019 Quarterly
Meeting.

Mark Fetzer made a motion for approval. Motion was seconded by Chairman Capodice. The
motion was approved by a 4-0 vote as follows: Mr. Capodice— yes; Mr. Fetzer— yes; Mr.
Smithson—yes; Mr. Cumpston—yes.

B. Consideration, review and approval of Minutes from the September 5, 2018 Special
Meeting.

Mark Fetzer made a motion for approval. Motion was seconded by Chairman Capodice. The
motion was approved by a 4-0 vote as follows: Mr. Capodice— yes; Mr. Fetzer— yes; Mr.
Smithson—yes; Mr. Cumpston—yes.

5. REGULAR AGENDA

A. Code Enforcement Pamphlet

Manger Snedden presented the preliminary draft of intended overall Community Development,
Code Enforcement Division Pamphlet. Asked for board input.

Mr. Fetzer expressed would be nice to hand out to first time property owners, property
management companies and realtor associations.

1



Mr. Garcia suggested this pamphlet could potentially be sent out in the water billing procedure for
first time water users. Also made suggestions of adding typical timelines to inspection process
portion and suggested adding the solid waste collection center hours to the pamphlet.

B. Rental Program Checklist
Manager Snedden presented registration form and checklist information.
Mr. Fetzer asked to add Carbon/Smoke to checklist.
Mr. Cumpston asked for clarification of location on website. Asked for accessibility of checklist
information be available to tenants.
6. OLD BUSINESS
A. Ordinance 2019-14

Manager Snedden presented final language as adopted by the council of the ordinance amending
the city code requiring Carbon Monoxide Detectors.

B. Sample Compliance Order
Manager Snedden presented a sample of a Compliance Order at boards request.
Mr. Capodice asked for clarification of Administrative Court procedures as it pertains to appeal.
Mr. Snedden explained the upfront procedures. And the reasons a case may not be presented to the
PMRB. Requested PMRB opportunity be added to the code enforcement pamphlet.

7. NEW BUSINESS

A. Chairman Capodice expressed his desire to have the word “mortgage” struck from the code.
Transfer of Ownership Requirements — Chapter 45, Section 107.6

Mr. Snedden explained it would be a code change.

B. Board asked to eliminate the two tenant seats due to past inability to fill seats. Mr. Snedden

read what the current board make up is currently and stated the request would take council action.
8. ADJOURNMENT

Mr. Garcia made a motion to adjourn; seconded by Mr. Fetzer. The motion passed unanimously
by voice vote. Meeting was adjourned at 4:37 PM.

Prepared (5/3/2019)



ILLINOIS

\\’;gé&%i«//a%

TO: Property Maintenance Review Board

FROM: Bob Mahrt, Community Development Director

DATE: January 23, 2020

RE: Discussion on proposed adoption of the 2018 International Property Maintenance

Code and amendments to the Bloomington City Code Chapter 45.

BACKGROUND:

The Property Maintenance Review Board (PMRB) has the authority to make advisory
recommendations to the City Council concerning amendments to the Property Maintenance Code,
Chapter 45 of the City Code. On February 24, 2014, the City Council adopted Ordinance No. 2014-
12 which amended Chapter 45 and adopted the 2012 International Property Maintenance Code
(IPMC). (A copy of the Ordinance is attached for review).

The ICC publishes new editions of the codes every three years. It should be understood, that the
City did not adopt the 2015 edition of the ICC codes. There is a need to illustrate the changes
between the various editions of the codes (2012-2015-2018) for public awareness.

The Community Development Department is simultaneously assisting the Building Board of
Appeals (BBA) and the PMRB on updating to the 2018 International Code Council family of
codes. This coordination effort is intended to provide adequate opportunities for review of the
updated editions of the ICC family of codes and provide appropriate public outreach. It is the
intent of the City to adopt and implement the new edition of the codes by May 1, 2020.

ITEMS FOR CONTINUED DISCUSSION:

1. Public Outreach: The Board should discuss the appropriate mechanisms for public
outreach and participation. Similar to the BBA, the Board may consider the need to schedule
monthly meetings through Winter/Spring 2020, outline opportunities to public awareness on the
pending updates, and for Community Development Department Staff to coordinate outreach
efforts with the Home Builder’s Association and other organizations (i.e. Board of Realtors,
labor unions, contractor associations).

2. Timeline: The Board should consider the potential timeline for review and adoption of the
IPMC. The Board would have the opportunity to amend or extend the timeline, as may be
necessary. (Please see the draft of the Potential Timeline).

3. Process: Staff has prepared a spreadsheet outlining the specific changes to the various
editions of the codes to assist the Board and the community to better understand the progressive



changes over time. (A copy is attached for review). Staff will review the spreadsheet with the
Board to determine if any exceptions from the 2018 IPMC should be considered.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION: That the Property Maintenance Review Board discuss the
proposed adoption of the 2018 International Property Maintenance Code and amendments to the
Bloomington City Code Chapter 45.




CITY OF BLOOMINGTON
2014-12
An Ordinance Amending Bloomington City Code Chapter 45. Property Maintenance Code
Adopted by the City Council

Of the City of Bloomington
on March 10, 2014

Published in pamphlet form by authority of the City Council of the
City of Bloomington, McLean County, Illinois, on March 11, 2014




ORDINANCE NO. 2014 - 1
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING BLOOMINGTON CITY CODE CHAPTER 45
BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Bloomington, Illinois:

SECTION 1. That Bloomington City Code Chapter 45, Article I, Section 1, shall be and
the same is hereby amended to read as follows (additions are indicating by underlining; deletions
are indicated by strikeouts):

SEC. 1: ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE 2012
2009

That a certain document, one (1) copy of which is on file in the office of the City Clerk of
the City of Bloomington, being marked and designated as "The International Property
Maintenance Code, 2009 2012" as published by the International Code Council, Inc., be and is
hereby adopted as the Property Maintenance code of the City of Bloomington, in the State of
Illinois, for the control of buildings and structures as herein provided; and each and all of the
regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Property Maintenance Code are
hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the
additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in ARTICLE I of this Ordinance.

SECTION 2. That Bloomington City Code Chapter 45, Article II, Sections 103.5, 107.3,
108.0, 108.2.1, 108.6, 108.7, 111, 111.1, 308.0, 308.4, 404.5, 404.5.1, 404.5.2, 506.3 shall be
and the same is hereby amended to read as follows (additions are indicating by underlining;
deletions are indicated by strikeouts):

ARTICLE IT

AMENDMENTS, REVISIONS, ADDITIONS AND MODIFICATIONS
TO THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE 2669 2012

SEC. 103.5 FEES.
Insert the following two sections at the end of the paragraph:

(@  Reinspection Fee. If a contractor/owner notifies the Code Official that a project is
ready for final inspection and, upon inspection the Code Official finds the project not complete,
then the Contractor/Owner shall pay a fee of Twenty-five Dollars ($25.00) per inspector for each
reinspection required. The fee shall be paid prior to any subsequent the reinspection.

(b)  Inspection Fee for Code Compliance. Ifrequested, an inspection/ investigation of
an existing building/facility for Code compliance may be done by the Code Official or employee
charged with enforcement of this code with authorization from the owner. A fee of Ten Dollars
($10.00) per inspector shall be charged for said inspection/investigation.



Add to SEC. 107.3 METHOD OF SERVICE.

@ Transmitted via e-mail to the email address of the owner or owner’s agent.
SEC. 108.0 UNSAFE STRUCTURES AND EQUIPMENT.

Add the following Sections to read as follows:
SEC. 108.2.2 10823+ CLOSING STANDARDS.

Structures shall be closed with uniform materials, cut to fit in a workmanlike manner,
securely attached and painted to match the surrounding surfaces.

SEC. 108.8 108:6 ADMINISTRATIVE FEE AND FINES FOR OWNING CONDEMNED
PROPERTY.

(a)  Any person who owns a structure condemned under this Code and who fails to
bring the structure into compliance with this code within one (1) year of the condemnation exder-
to-eondemn shall be assessed a fee of five hundred dollars ($500.00).

(b)  If the same structure referred to in paragraph (a) of this Section is not in
compliance with this code within eighteen (18) months of the condemnation erder-te-condemn,
the owner shall be fined an additional seven hundred and fifty dollars ($750.00) for-the-second-

it O otooanoaoial O oot - v

i ]o .] ]- gi'

(¢)  Ifthe same structure referred to in paragraph (a) of this Section is not in
compliance with this code within two (2) years of the condemnation, erderte-condemn; the
owner shall pay a fine of two thousand dollars ($2,000.00). The owner shall be fined an-

- additienal two thousand dollars ($2,000.00) for the-second-year-and-two-thousand delHars-for
each additional year thereafter in-whiekh that the structure remains condemned. isnetin-

complianee-with-this-Cede:

(d)  Any person who owns a structure already condemned under this Code and who
has a second structure condemned shall be assessed an additional fine of ($2,000.00) for each

yeat the second structure remains on the condemned list. The-fine-shall-be-$2,000-00-per-year-
£ the f e tal £ ; L list.

()  Any person who owns two (2) structures condemned under this Code and who has

a third or more structures condemned shall be assessed a fine of five thousand dollars ,
($5,000.00) per structure for every year they remain on the condemned list. Fhe-fineshall-be-

ve-thousand - dollars{3$5,000-00)-per-structure-per-year-evenifthe-first and second-structures-are

v v

Ciro VAVAV

0

removed-fromthe-condemnedlist:

The administrative fees and fines authorized by this Section shall be a lien on any real
estate owned by such person. In addition to filing a lien upon such real estate, the City shall




have the authority to collect such fees or fines by filing an ordinance violation suit or a personal
collection action against the owner in court.

SEC. 108.9 1087 NOTICE TO BUYERS OF CONDEMNED STRUCTURE.

(@ Code Enforcement Division to Publish List. The Department of Planning and
Code Enforcement, Code Enforcement Division, shall each month compile and publish a list of
all structures which have been condemned and any Code violations existing in any structure on
the list shall be public information and shall be disclosed to any person making inquiry. In
addition, the Division shall disclose to any person making inquiry the location of any other
structure condemned since the publication of the most recent list of condemned structures. A
copy of the monthly list of condemned structures shall be sent to the Bloomington-Normal Board
of Realtors to be made available to any members thereof. When any structure is condemned,
notification of condemnation along with a copy of the inspection sheet with regard to said
property shall be forwarded to the Bloomington-Normal Board of Realtors.

(b)  Contents of Notice. The notices provided for in this Section shall contain the
following information:

(1)  the common street address of the property;
(2)  the legal description or real estate index number of the property;
(3)  the fact that the structure on the property has been "Condemned";

(4)  the Code deficiencies found to exist on the property (which may be
in the form of an attached inspection sheet) and the fact that
occupancy of the structure is prohibited until necessary repairs are
made, and if known, an approximate cost estimate of the cost of
making sufficient repairs to permit occupancy of the structure.

(¢)  Real Estate Agent Must Give Notice of Defects. It shall be unlawful for any real
estate agent to permit a person to execute a formal offer to purchase any property on which a
condemned structure is located without furnishing said person a copy of the notice required by
this Section and obtaining written receipt of such notice. The original of said notice and receipt
shall be forwarded to the Code Enforcement Division.

Delete the entire Section 111 and substitute the following:

SEC. 111 MEANS OF APPEAL.

SEC. 111.1 Any person directly affected by a decision of the Code Official or a Notice or Order
issued under this Property Maintenance Code shall have the right to appeal to the Property

Maintenance Board of Review as provided in Section 1000 of this Chapter.




SEC. 308.0 RUBBISH AND GARBAGE
The following section shall be added:
SEC. 308.4 APPROVED REFUSE CONTAINER.

(1) A can made of galvanized iron or lined with galvanized iron, of not more
thirty/thirty-three (30-33) gallon capacity, which is watertight, has a tight fitting
cover and two (2) handles; or

(2)  aheavy duty durable plastic container of not more than thirty/thirty-three (30-33)
- gallon capacity, which is watertight, has a tight fitting cover and has two (2)
handles; or

(3)  plastic refuse bags meeting specifications established by the Director of Public
Service and approved by the City Manager.

4) Wheeled garbage carts issued exclusively by the City through the Department of
Public Works or its designee or vendor as provided in Chapter 21 of the

Bloomington City Code.
SEC. 404.0 LIGHT, VENTILATIONS AND OCCUPANCY LIMITATIONS.

The following section shall be added:




Delete Section 506.3 Grease interceptors.

SECTION 3. That except as provided herein, the Bloomington City Code, as amended,
shall remain in full force and effect.

SECTION 4. The City Clerk shall be, and she is hereby directed and authorized to
publish this Ordinance in pamphlet form as provided by law.

SECTION 5. This Ordinance is enacted pursuant to the authority granted to the City as a
home rule unit by Article VII, Section 6 of the 1970 Illinois Constitution.

SECTION 6. This Ordinance shall take effect ten (10) days after passage and approval.
PASSED this 10 day of March, 2014.

APPROVED this W~day of March, 2014.

APPROVED:
1 -
| ans Kenr)a/ pr{ 4%4@ WSSl oLt
Tari Renner % —
Mayor /L/)!/-L{N 0 /éV)/\
ATTEST:
N -
L’\) ™ u.u\C—\b
Tracey Covert

City Clerk



STATE OF ILLINOIS )
) ss.
COUNTY OF MCLEAN ) .
CERTIFICATE

I, Tracey Covert, certify that I am the duly appointed and qualified municipal clerk of the City of
Bloomington, County of McLean, Illinois.

I further certify that on the Corporate Authorities of the above municipality passed and approved
Ordinance No. 2014-12, entitled An Ordinance Amending Bloomington City Code Chapter 45.
Property Maintenance Code which provided by its terms that it should be published in pamphlet
form.

The pamphlet form of this Ordinance, including the Ordinance and cover sheet thereof, was
prepared, and a copy of the Ordinance was posted in the municipal building, commencing on
March 10, 2014 and continuing for at least ten days thereafter. Copies of the Ordinance were
also available for public inspection upon request in the office of the municipal clerk

Dated at Bloomington, Illinois, on March 11, 2014
by, Sl

Tracey Covert
City Clerk




Potential Timeline

PMRB Final Draft PMRB Advisory
Kick-off Discussion Review February Recommendation City Council Approval
January 23, 2020 28, 2020 March ??, 2020 April 13, 2020
Nt
Outreach / City Council C.O.W. ICC Code
Notices to Presentation / Implementation
Community Discussion May 1, 2020
Stakeholders March 23, 2020

February - March




INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE AMENDMENTS (IPMC 2012 - IPMC 2015 -IPMC 2018)

ADDITION/DELETION/MODIFICATION/CLARIFICATION

ADMINISTRATION CHAPTER 1

SECTION NUMBER SECTION HEADING AMENDMENT SUMMARY

101.2 SCOPE MODIFICATION ADDED AUTHORIZED AGENT FOR RESPONSIBILTY OF PREMISES

102.2 MAINTENANCE MODIFICATION ADDED AUTHORIZED AGENT FOR RESPONSIBILTY OF PREMISES

102.3 APPLICATION OF OTHER CODES MODIFICATION ADDED REFERENCE TO "INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE"
103.4 LIABILITY MODIFICATION ADDED "CIVILLY OR CRIMINALLY"

103.4.1 LEGAL DEFENSE MODIFICATION AMMENDED SEC. 103.4 TO BE TWO CODE SECTIONS

104.3 RIGHT OF ENTRY MODIFICATION ADDED AUTHORIZED AGENT FOR RESPONSIBILTY OF PREMISES

105.1 MODIFICATIONS MODIFICATION ADDED AUTHORIZED AGENT FOR RESPONSIBILTY OF PREMISES

105.2 ALTERNATIVE MATERIALS, DESIGN AND METHODS ADDITION ADDED SENTENCE FOR WHAT TO DO WHEN CONSTRUCTION IS NOT APPROVED
105.2 ALTERNATIVE MATERIALS, DESIGN AND METHODS CLARIFICATION REVISED DEFINITIONS AND NEW REQUIREMENTS FOR ALT. MAT. DESIGN AND METHODS
107.2 FORM MODIFICATION ADDED OWNER'S AUTHORIZED AGENT

107.6 TRANSFER OF OWNERSHIP MODIFICATION ADDED OWNER'S AUTHORIZED AGENT

108.2 CLOSING OF VACANT STRUCTURES MODIFICATION ADDED OWNER'S AUTHORIZED AGENT

108.2.1 AUTHORITY TO DISCONNECT SERVICE UTILITIES MODIFICATION ADDED OWNER'S AUTHORIZED AGENT

108.3 NOTICE MODIFICATION ADDED OWNER'S AUTHORIZED AGENT

108.6 ABATEMENT METHODS MODIFICATION ADDED OWNER'S AUTHORIZED AGENT

109.5 COSTS OF EMERGENCY REPAIRS MODIFICATION ADDED OWNER'S AUTHORIZED AGENT

110.1 GENERAL MODIFICATION ADDED OWNER'S AUTHORIZED AGENT

110.3 FAILURE TO COMPLY MODIFICATION ADDED OWNER'S AUTHORIZED AGENT

112.2 ISSUANCE MODIFICATION ADDED OWNER'S AUTHORIZED AGENT

DEFINITIONS CHAPTER 2

SECTION NUMBER SECTION HEADING AMENDMENT SUMMARY

202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS (APPROVED) MODIFICATION CHANGED DEF. FROM "APPROVED TO ACCEPTABLE"

202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS (COST OF SUCH DEMOLITION OR EMERGENCY REPAIRS) ADDITION ADDED DEF OF "COST OF SUCH DEMOLITION OR EMERGENCY REPAIR"
202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS (HISTORIC BUILDING) ADDITION ADDED DEF OF "HISTORIC BUILDING"

202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS (INFESTATION) MODIFICATION ADDED "RODENTS"

202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS (LABELED) MODIFICATION CHANGED "INSPECTION AGENCY TO APPROVED AGENCY"

202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS (PUBLIC WAY) CLARIF/ADD CLARIFY "UNOBSTRUCTED" ; ADDED CLEAR WIDTH AND HIGHT OF 10 FEET
202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS (STRUCTURE) MODIFICATION REMOVED "OR A PORTION THEREOF"

GENERAL REQUIREMENTS CHAPTER 3

SECTION NUMBER SECTION HEADING AMENDMENT SUMMARY

NO CHANGES IN CHAPTER 3 FROM 2012 TO 2018

LIGHT, VENTILATION, AND OCCUPANCY LIMITATIONS CHAPTER 4

SECTION NUMBER SECTION HEADING AMENDMENT SUMMARY




NO CHANGES IN CHAPTER 4 FROM 2012 TO 2018

PLUMBING FACILITIES AND FIXTURE REQUIREMENTS CHAPTER 5

SECTION NUMBER SECTION HEADING AMENDMENT SUMMARY

505.5 NONPOTABLE WATER REUSE SYSTEMS ADDITION ADDED NEW CODE SECTION 505.5

505.5.1 ABANDONMENT OF SYSTEMS ADDITION ADDED NEW CODE SECTION 505.5.1

MECHANICAL AND ELECTRICAL REQUIREMENTS  CHAPTER 6

SECTION NUMBER SECTION HEADING AMENDMENT SUMMARY

603.1 MECHANICAL EQUIPMENT AND APPLIANCES MODIFICATION CHANGED SECTION HEADING TO "MECHANICAL EQUIPMENT AND APPLIANCES
FIRE SAFETY REQUIREMENTS

SECTION NUMBER SECTION HEADING AMENDMENT SUMMARY

703.1 FIRE-RESISTANCE-RATED ASSEMBLIES MODIFICATION MAINTAINING INTEGRITY OF REQUIRED FIRE RATED ASSEMBLIES

703.2 UNSAFE CONDITIONS ADDITION MAINTAINING FIRE RESISTANT COMPONENTS TO ORIGINAL LEVEL OF SAFETY
703.3 MAINTENANCE ADDITION OWNER REQUIREMENTS FOR MAINTENANCE OF FIRE RATED COMPONENTS AND ASSEMBLIES
703.3.1 FIRE BLOCKING AND DRAFT STOPPING ADDITION MAINTENANCE REQUIREMENTS FOR FIREBLOCKING

703.3.2 SMOKE BARRIERS AND SMOKE PARTITIONS ADDITION MAINTENANCE REQUIREMENTS FOR SMOKE BARRIERS

703.3.3 FIRE WALL, FIRE BARRIERS, AND FIRE PARTITIONS ADDITION MAINTENANCE REQUIREMENTS FOR FIRE WALLS

703.4 OPENING PROTECTIVES MODIFICATION 2018 IPMC RE-WRITE AND RE-NUMBER OF CODE SECTION 703.2 TO 703.4
703.4.1 SIGNS ADDITION SIGNAGE REQUIREMENTS FOR FIRE RATED DOORS

703.4.2 HOLD-OPEN DEVICES AND CLOSERS ADDITION MAINTENANCE REQUIREMENTS FOR FIRE RATED DOOR DEVICES

703.4.3 DOOR OPERATION ADDITION MAINTAINING FIRE DOOR SWING REQUIREMENTS

703.5 CEILINGS ADDITION MAINTAINING ACOUSTICAL CEILINGS THAT ARE PART OF A FIRE RATED SYSTEM
703.6 TESTING ADDITION FIRE DOOR TESTING REQUIREMENTS

703.7 VERTICAL SHAFTS ADDITION FIRE PROTECTION REQUIREMENTS FOR VERTICAL SHAFTS

703.8 OPENING PROTECTIVE CLOSERS ADDITION MAINTAINING SELF CLOSING OPENINGS

704.1 INSPECTION, TESTING AND MAINTENANCE ADDITION REQUIREMENTS FOR FIRE DETECTION, ALARMS AND EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS
704.1.1 INSTALLATION ADDITION FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEM INSTALLATION REQUIREMENTS

704.1.2 FIRE DEPARTMENT CONNECTION ADDITION 2015 IPMC ADDED NEW CODE SECTION 704.1.2 ELIMINATED IN 2018 IPMC
704.1.2 REQUIRED FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS ADDITION REFERENCE TO IFC AND IBC CODES FOR FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS

704.1.3 FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS ADDITION FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS REQUIRING INSPECTION AND MAINTENANCE
704.2 SINGLE- AND MULTIPLE-STATION SMOKE ALARMS ADDITION 2015 IPMC ADDED NEW CODE SECTION 704.2 ELIMINATED IN 2018 IPMC
704.2 STANDARDS ADDITION FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEM MAINTENANCE STANDARDS

704.2.1 WHERE REQUIRED ADDITION 2015 IPMC ADDED NEW CODE SECTION 704.2.1 ELIMINATED IN 2018 IPMC
704.2.1 RECORDS ADDITION FIRE SYSTEM RECORD REQUIREMENTS

704.2.1.1 GROUP R-1 DELETION ELIMINATED IN 2018 IPMC

704.2.1.2 GROUPS R-2, R-3, R-4 AND I-1 DELETION ELIMINATED IN 2018 IPMC

704.2.1.3 INSTALLATION NEAR COOKING APPLIANCES DELETION ELIMINATED IN 2018 IPMC

704.2.1.4 INSTALLATION NEAR BATHROOMS DELETION ELIMINATED IN 2018 IPMC




704.2.2 INTERCONNECTION DELETION ELIMINATED IN 2018 IPMC

704.2.2 RECORDS INFORMATION ADDITION FIRE SYSTEM RECORD REQUIREMENTS

704.2.3 POWER SOURCE DELETION ELIMINATED IN 2018 IPMC

704.2.4 SMOKE DETECTION SYSTEM DELETION ELIMINATED IN 2018 IPMC

704.3 SYSTEM OUT OF SERVICE ADDITION FIRE DEPT AND CODE OFFICIAL NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS
704.3.1 EMERGENCY IMPAIRMENTS ADDITION EMERGENCY ACTION REQUIREMENTS

704.4 REMOVAL OF OR TAMPERING WITH EQUIPMENT ADDITION UNLAWFUL TAMPERING CODE

704.4.1 REMOVEAL OF OR TAMPERING WITH APPURTENANCES ADDITION UNLAWFUL TAMPERING CODE

704.4.2 REMOVEAL OF EXISTING OCCUPANT-USE HOSE LINES ADDITION

704.4.3 TERMINATION OF MONITORING SERVICE ADDITION NOTICE OF TERMINATION REQUIREMENTS

704.5 FIRE DEPARTMENT CONNECTION ADDITION FD CONNECTION REQUIREMENTS

704.5.1 FIRE DEPARTMENT CONNECTION ACCESS ADDITION FD CONNECTION ACCESS REQUIREMENTS

704.5.2 CLEAR SPACE AROUND CONNECTIONS ADDITION CLEAR SPACE REQUIREMENTS

704.7 SINGLE- AND MULTIPLE-STATION SMOKE ALARMS ADDITION ALARM TESTING AND MAINTENANCE

705.1 & 705.2 CARBON MONOXIDE ALARMS AND DETECTION ADDITION CARBON MONOXIDE ALARMS AND DETECTION REQUIREMENTS
REFERENCED STANDARDS CHAPTER 8

SECTION NUMBER SECTION HEADING AMENDMENT SUMMARY

APPENDIX A - BOARDING STANDARD

SECTION NUMBER SECTION HEADING AMENDMENT SUMMARY




0T0T/s 1 i T86LIYYE/m00"09¢ap0ay/:sdny

:uopreuiogu] 3uimoyioy ey Ajddns jreys Sujpiing 1oyaJap e BuliaisiSal Jaumo ay L

‘uopewJoul uoneisidaa pasinbay [ 9-oo1L -dag G ‘Y] 90£-9v §

[96-L10z *oN "pi0]
Pl
are1dosdde Jayao Jo aanounfu quawSpn| e Joy juswiedaq [eSar aya ySnoayz suep INa4D ayp 03 Aiddy  (€)

“Auadoud aya uo Juswazeqe
2Ns JO 350D 5Y3 Joy us)) & ede(d pue sasjwa.d ay3 uo Supsixs suope|olA 3pod A1) Jo adues|nu Aue s1eqy  (2)

‘fuiadoud sya o uoRIPUOD BYY BUILLISIBP 0F saswald
83 Jo uopnadsul Suimo[e JuBLIEM UD.IeSS SAIFRIIS|UIIPE U t0f Juawitiedaq [e8a ay3 ySnoays Alddy (1)

Aew qustudoj@Asq ALUNWILLIOD JO 1019341 a3 ‘palagsiBaiun sujewsd Suy
a3 pue peisod to/pue pajrew s snyess Sulp|ing 10124ap 4o ad130u Aep ay3 wouy ssdefd shep b1 ueyy 0w T

[96-L107 *ON "P40O]
*snye3s Suip|ing
I24[343p Jo uoRedlIoU 2yl jo Bunsod Jo/pue Bujiew ay3 jo sAep JNoJ UM PBAISDAL UBS] 3ARY 0} _umemn
U39 DABY |[BYS UOIIRDIHION "UCIIEDLIISA 10} ucwan_m%n_ bE:EEou J0 wswedsg ayl £q uonoadsu)
ue Jo4 85URIIE PUB BD130U 8Y3 Ul paldads snyess Sup|ing 12[j849p O UCIIBUILIISIBP 104 SUOSER] By Apawal
‘uojzediI0U Jo shep o1 ulyIMm Kew Jaumo syl ‘uone.siSad Jo nay) uj Juswdojprsg Ayunwwo? Jo uswiedsq
ays 03 ueyd Suipying 39yjaJep e 3wigns pue Sulp|ing a21jeJap e se Sulp|ing yans 1e1si8a1 ‘UojIed|10U JO SABP OL
uiyam ‘eys upiing yons jo Jeumo ay 1 Buipiing auy3 uodn paisod aq Aetu sopou ‘Kiinbu) enp uodn paupwisiap
8 JOULED SSOIPPE §,J5UMO aY3 §| "sn3els SuIp|ing 151]245p 10 UOIIBU[ULIDISP 10} SUOSEDL BY]T 318IS ||2YS
ani0u yong -ueid 3uipjing 1o1319p & ywgns pue Suipying sya Ja3si3a. 03 Suping ay3 Jo Jaumo syl Supsanbal
[lew ssB[D 351 Ag JUSS 19138] AQ JOUMO UMOU 15B| 33 01 93130 apiaoad [[BYS [2ID11J0 JUBSISIIOHS 10 10D
a3 ‘@dUBUIP.O SiY3 jo YoE-SF § jo Buluesaw a3 UM 1D1RISP ST SUIPIING B TBYI SSUILISISP JOPBAA YT Ag
pateudisap [eR10 8pod 10 JuswidojpAsg ANUNWLIOY J0 103231 Y3 | *SNIe3s SuIp|Ing I01[3.48p 4O UOIEIHHION g

[68-8102 ‘ON 'p4Q]

*Me| [e1apa4 J0 31e1S ‘UojBuiwoo|g Jo A1 3y} Jo

S3DUBUIPJO 3Y3 Aq Jos papirc.d saizeuad 4o saul “58a) Jay1o AUk 03 UOIPPE U] 3JE UOIIDaS SIY3 U] 4oy papiaotd

S99y ||V 'S894 JO SINPSYDS S} Ul Y04 195 S 98y uojIealsi3a. v passasse aq |feys Suip|ing ples Joy uojielisiSal

[enuue Juanbasqns yoey *s894 40 9|NPaYDS BY3 U] Y04 305 se aay e Aed pue Suip|ing yons jo uonessiSeu mauas

Jfeys Jaumo ay3 ‘polad uoieaisidau Aue jo uoreaidxs aul e 1(jRJIap surewal Suip|ing ay3 i “uoiealsiSal jo

93ep 93 Wo.y Jeak auo Jo poad e 1o} pifea aq [[eys Bulp|ing 10][2.9p € 40 uoiFe.lsiSay 'sead 4O BjNPaLdS BY3 uj

304 39S S JUNOWIE UE U} 4O 89 UolTe.3siSal & yum Jayra8o) quawdopas@ Aunwiwo) Jo Juswiredad oyl yym

papy aq Jjeys ueld pue uonessiBea Suip(ing 1ojassp ayL ued Suip(ing 1o11948p B Jwgns pue Suip|ing 104918p
e se Suip|ing yons 4a3s13a.1 [[eYS 9DUBUIPIO SIY3 Jo YOE-SF § up pauyep se Sulp|ing ID1B1ap B Jo Jaumo Auy v

*sSuipjing 11a18ap 4331804 03 uonesiqo [ §ooLl dvs Gk "yy] SoE-Sv §

0

*(s)3ueuay Jo (s)seumo 3jqenba o [eBs| ays se Suiping ey 4o Jued
Aue uy aal] J0 BpISa Ajjnyme] Jo ‘ssaulsng pasuad); A|injame; e 3onpuod Ausaina ‘Ajenioe suossad Jo uostad oN
a3aldNIDONN

“U0DLBY3 S8IMIDNAS Jo sTuIp[INg ay3 Buipnpul pue) jo [aoJed Lo 301d o] v
S3SINAUd

“1nod e Aq Aiadoud feau jo uojssassod axe) 03 passpdo Ji uossad yons

40 318159 BYJ 4O JOJRIISIUJLUPE 10 J0INDBXB BY3 pue ‘osJad yons AUe Jo 53e3ss 343 o ueipend sy Suipnjou)
‘Radoad aya 4o jo.3uon Suiary ssmasylo Jo Kuadoud ayp 01 spp Buipioy se Ayedpiuntu Jo AJunod ‘a3els ay3

930 7 a8eg uoneAIsald pooyroquseN I ‘woiSurwoos Jo A1)

020T/S1/1 T86LIFE/NO0"09EaP0Ds//:sdny

4O SpJoI3J JRIDIO 243 U] papJodad Jo ‘Auadodd sy uo a8eS1iow e Buspjoy Lo Ksadoud sy Uy 1sauaiy) BjqeHnbs
do 1eda} e Suiaey Aaus say3o Jo Auedwos Ayjiqe)| paywi] ‘uoiresodsod ‘uilyy ‘Joletado Quade ‘uossad Auy
JANMO

[96-L10T ‘oN *pJO]
"aauBisap Jay L0 sty 03 Jo quatudoEasg AYUNWWOD 4o 101331 U3 03 33 [[YS ‘UlRJaY pasn sy
1S8p I8y 10 sty | ¥ a8y ey Y p:
ANINEOTIAIA ALINNWAIOD 40 YO1D3dIa

[1-Loz 'oN *pI0]
“9DUEBSINU & 81BGR 0 JO SUOIIE|OIA 9POD BJ0W
40 2UO 3031103 03 Panss] Udaq sey JapJo ue swiz yoiym Surinp pue sAep 06 ueyy alow Joj paidnasouny  °3

Jo fauow Jo shep of
103 Supsixe suoizejola apod Suipjing Jo aJyy ‘edueuiuew ALadoud omy ueys siow Sujaey pue paidnadoun  *q

Jo ¢dn papJeoq aue
s8ujuado JaL30 10 ‘SMopuIM ‘S00p asoym sBuIp|Ing sapN[oU] SIY oW JO SABp OF 4oy US|Sap J0 81N3IN.3S
Jejjwis Jo sSupjing yo uSjsap ay3 Ut pasnh A|jewriou asoy3 UeL Jay30 suedw Aq peandssun pue paidnadoun D

10 U0 Jo sAep sAY Joj paJndasun pue paidnoooun g

Jo fpauliepuo) vy

ONIATINgG LO173¥3a

punoJ su3 03 paxyge Aiustrewad s| YdiyM pue pup|
Aue jo f11adoud sjgesow Jo “m_wﬁmzu ‘siewijue ‘ajdoad 4o aunsopus 4o “azjays ‘Hoddns syl 404 JING SUNIONIS ¥
ONIaTING

‘suoniuyaq [roou -vag G¥ -ys] yoc-st §

‘lenald (eys Kages pue yiesy Joj prepuels 3sayBiy sy3 Sumss uoisiaoad sy3 91U JO JUDAS BY3 U] “suoie|nSa.
10 S3DUBUIPIO ‘S3POD ‘SME| JBYIO0 4O JUSWBDI0MS 312 JuABId 10 3| 01 PANLISUOD B4 30U |[BYS 3[13JE SIYL

[F1-110z "oN *pIQ]
*‘Sme] Jay30 uo 198443 [€-00LL 095 G 'yH] CoE-GF §

*sesod.ind s3] 1088 03 panuIsuod A|[eaq)| 8q [[eys ajo1e S|y L
‘spooyioqyBiau pue Aedo.d jusdefpe uo Joedwi astaape uanbasuod pue 3yBiq ApySisun wolresosIep usasad
03 s8ulpjing yons Joy uejd ssueusiulew e Juswa|dwy 03 sajiued ajqisuodsas Suilinbaa pue sujp|ing 33)2.19p 104
ssao0.d uopzeiisies & Sujysiqeiss Aq alejjam pue ‘A1aes ‘Yiesy dqnd ay3 198301d 03 3]21E SIY3 JO JUSI] BYI SI 3

[Fi-tLoz "oN 'pio]
29U [Z-oolL 395 ‘GP -yo] zoE-Sh §

“Pljplep Bujwodeq Jeyesiay Jo Sunsixe mou uoiduiwoold jo D ay3 Ul Joaisys sesjwa.d pue
s3upjing 321349p |fe 03 A|dde |jeys pue ,eoUBUIPIO UORRAISSId PooyloqySiaN, a3 Se UMOUY B4 |[eUS B[D1. YL

[ri-tioz *oN pUQ]
*djo134e Jo adoods pue apiL [1'00LL 238 ‘GF "yn] L0E-Sb §

930 1 a8eq UONBAISSAIJ POOYIOqUSIaN 11 ‘U0ISuTtuoo[d Jo A1)



020T/S1/1

03 3ySu 2yl aARY [[BYS JAUMO UDNS %0181 ay3 Aq apeWl SUCIEILIPOW dY3 03 $393(q0 Sulp|ing sy JO JoUMO BY3
# "UoIdE Jo spoyzaw pasodold ay3 Jo sdueulioyad jo serep oyl Suwalje Aq uejd sy Apow 01 YSL sy3 dAey
“ua8e s aumo Jo Jaumo Suiping 11j310p 2U3 01 220U uodn feys Juswido[EAag ANUNLWIWOD JO J0IDBIIC dY L

-ue|d pasodoud sy jo uonedyipow Jo [ercsdde woly Buiynsas Jaumo sy yo
ures Jo diysp.ey suy3 o3 pasedwod se “Ojjgnd Jo pooytoquSisu sy o3 ured so uo diyspJey aanepl syl (8)

‘Foz-1z § 1z Jedey) up psuyap se Auadoud ayy uo aduesinu oygnd Aue jo soussaad syl (3)
“Pijedep usaq sey uipling sy swi jo Yi8us| ayr (a)

‘uejd pasodoud ayy Juastusjdul 013502 ays. (p)

*AJuNLod 93 JO SUOJIIPUOD Djlwouods jesausdayl (9)

*Auadoud Supuiofpe uo ued pasodoud ay3 jo aye syl (q)

“19113.489p astmiaL3o o dn pap.aeoq s) Suip|ing
B 3W13 jo polad 8yl azZjwiujul 01 |[pUnod A31D AU JO JUSIUL 343 pue 9dIle iUy jo sasodund syl (e)

:paJepisuod aq fjeys s1039e Sumo)jo) sy ‘uefd Suipying 1o13.8p € Jo ssausiendo.sdde syz Bupspisuoo uy (1)

-uejd sy 4o uonEsYIpOL 10 UoIBfal qercldde au3 Jo Juade 5IBUMO IO JBUMO B3 03 JUDS
30 [[IM 92110 "UOIISS SIYY JO & UONDasANS Ut paqridsap se feadde 03 Y1 ay3 o1 1afgns ‘uejd Suipjing aoyjalep
pasodoud a3 Aipow Jo Ausp ‘@acidde o1 uonads|p aaey [jeys uswWdoBAsd AYUNWIWOD 4O JOIDBILQ BY L

_ T86LIHYE/00:09gap00s)/:sdny

k-]

v

-ue[d Jo fenoaddy [ 6-ooLL -das ‘Gb "yoH] 60¢- §

[1-1oz "oN "piO]
*sasjwa.d ayz o Jo ur Supsixe asuesinu Aue Jo UsWIaTege BUY 104 318D dYYdads v

“Butp|ing ay3 jo Uopjjowap o afes “Aduednano o3 uinas Ureds. Joy ajqelewl v

2 uodn
pazenoy aumponas 4o Bupjing Aue pue sasjwa.d auy3 jo desxdn pue soueusIULEW ‘@83 PANLIRUD 343 Joj Leld v
" -adf3 Jejjwis o UOEINISUOD
Mmau Joy paryuied Jo Sujpjing 8y o uSisep aY3 U] POSN SPOYIBW [EUOIIUSAUOD UBY3 Ja1L30 sueaw Aue Aq
pa.1n2as asimIay1o 20 dn papJeog aue yoiym sButuado JaL3o Jo ‘Smopuim ‘sioop Aue Jedea o3 uorde jo uejd v

‘a

D

11

v

$Buimojoy aya upeauod [feys ueyd sy
‘ue|d Sulp|inq 321[a.8p © HAGNS |[eys JueSe 40 JBUMO B3 ‘UlBIBY pauinbaa se paualsiBad s) Suipjing 101BJ8p B UBYM

-uejd Suipjinq 1pRIaq [ 8'00LL 285 ‘GF "yH] 8oL-SF §

[F1-10z 'oN 'PIO]

*AousBiawa 4o SSED Ul PRIDRIU0D

8q Aew oym QAUNOD UBSTO Ul SS3IPPE [B13USPISa J0 Jiom & Suturejuew Apred s|qisuodsa. & 4o UORWION]
1DBIUOD puUR SWRU By ‘Jewlo) joosdasyiesm 9[qiSa e ul ‘Buip|ing syl Jo J00p JuoLy syl uodn adeyd oL

*2d/A3 JejfuIs JO UORDNIISUGD MBU Jo) pariuiad spoytaw Aq Jo Buipiing sy jo uSisep a3 uj pash spoyraLy
[euojauaAL0D Ag sButuado |je aundas 01 pue s3ujuado Jay10 Jo ‘smopum ‘sioop Aue uRIURW pUe Jjedss o

“Me| [eJopad
pue 23835 ‘@poD A0 uoiBuiuioo|g sy jo suojsiaold sjqes)dde jje yam souedwod ut saladoud uejuew 01

930 ¢ o8eg

UoNRAISSaIJ PooyIoqydIeN I ‘uoidurwoo[d Jo A1)

020T/S /1

9Jo gefeq

“Buipying Joyao
Aue 10} 000C00LE UBY] $S3] 30U PUE ‘s3jun SujjjaMp JNoy UBYY 310U 30U SujuleILOD 38N [RIUBPISA] J0y AjlrRwd
pausisap s3ulpjing Joj 000‘COES Liey] SSB] 30U JUNOWE UE Uf 3ueInsu) A3[iqe]| [esoUas UIBJUIB PUB U[BIGO Of

‘adueyo ayy Joe sAep Ol UyUM UoREIISISo Yl
uo paJinbaJ uopewogut jo aBueyd Aue Liodau 03 pue a3 siyl Aq paainbau se sepadoad Jojatep Ja3siSal o,

T86LTHE/W0d 09£ap0oos;/:sduy

v

:paJdinbad aJe saied ajqisuodsad ssyro pue sjusde ‘sisumO

'saj3red o|qisuodsau

Jayio pue sauade ‘susumo jo syuswaiinbay [£L 0oLt *dag GF 'yn] LoE-S¥ §

[¥1-uoz "oN "pio]
-Bujpassoid 1inod 4o aaeASUIWPE
Aue uj 3292400 pue anJ3 910k} ewild se paidedde aq jjeys w.of UoIeIISISad BYI UO BPRW SIUBWIAILS

9[211Ie S|y} Jo 01€-5P § U] papiacid se auyy
e Ag a|geysiund aq [jim UoRDISANS sly3 Aq paujnbad se safueyd Lodad 03 aunjed -s8ueyd syl Jale sAep oL Uyl
uognes3sias syz uo paainbas uopewoju] Jo a8ueyd Aue uode. 3snw Ausdoud e se3siSa. 03 pauinbal ssumo Auy

*9DIE S1Y3 JO OLE
-5t § up papiao.d se sauly 03 198[gns 3q pue Jo3s(8a. 03 pajje} DARY 0} PAWSSP B |[BYS UOIIDBS SIYF AG pauinbed
uoFeLLLIOJUl Y3 dpiaoad 03 sjiey oym JauUMo Uy “uolretisiSal Sujp|ing 321ja1ap Jo sasodind Joy paidanse aq
30U [[im pue 839]dW0D PaJapISUOD 3q 30U |(IM U01D3S iyl Aq paJinbaa uoiewojul ay3 Suppse| uoessiZea Auy

fuadoud sy jo soueusjueWw
puE [0J3U0D ‘uore.asiBad ay3 03 Sujurersad suajieW U] JaUMO BY3 Wouy A3oyine 30a.1ip yum Suide uossed
e 40 Ayadoud sy 4o JBUMO BYI SIS BJB LBy TBY3 A48 IsNw w0y uonensiBa. ay3 SujuSis uosiad ayL

“Ja1[2q pue aSpamouy| ‘UoewIou] suossad BT JO 3584
93 031 3020103 PUR SN.IY 5| JUSLWSIEIS Ples Lo ORI SY3 ey uosiad Jeyl A UOERILIIISI B PUR JUSLWISIEIS
uojre.ssi8a. aya Sutredaid uossed sy jo saquinu suoydajay pue ssaappe Suljew ‘SSaIpPE 399435 ‘DRl BY L

*8DUBUIPJO SIU3 JO 80E-SY § Ul paquusap sk ‘uejd Sulp|ing 1)ja18p ¥

“1ipep swedaq Sulp)ing Sy YdIym Uo 31ep By

*AousSiaWa JO 9SED U] POIDRIUCD

2q ABW OYM PUB BDUBUSIUIBW 40 S4833BW U] A3adoud Byl Jo [043U0D Uf 358 03 paziioyine AJUNOD) UBSTIN

U] SS2.PpE. [RRUBPISSI 10 dj4om B Sujureiurew uostad e Jo saquinu suoyda|el pue ssauppe [edisAyd ‘eweu aty |
‘sioutj]l “Aunod ueso U Bulpisa. pue sse20.d 4o adjAlas 3dad0E 01 paziioyINe QuaBe Ue Jo Jaquinu
suoyda|s3 pue ssauppe [edjsAud ‘eweu sy3 spiaoad asnw usSe 1o Jsumo BupisiSad syp ‘Aus ssauisng

1330 40 3snuy pue| “Auedwiod Ayjige)| paawy ‘diysisulsed ‘wopeiod.aod e Aq paumo s) Atadoad syz i (2)

Jo {(sassaJppe [edisAyd padinbaJ jo naj| u) sjqeidadoe
2q [[iM $s21ppe x0q 321330 350d ou) Anadosd syl 4o siouMo [[B jo sassalppe [es(shyd pue saweu ayy (L)

*parenas s{ Bulpjing 3o1j24ap BU3 Y2NyM UO sasiwa.d
ay3 jo Jaquinu uopieayiusp] [9oJed xel pue uojadiiosap [eda) ‘(sseappe 392J15) UOIAIIDSAP UOWIWOD BY L

UONEBAISSAI] POOYIOqUSION I ‘UCISUNOO[E 3o A1)



0zZ0T/ST/1

T86LIPYE/WOd"09Epoosy/:sduy

Inq 101j349p Jo A135i85. B3 WOy paacwal aq |[eys Auadosd

8y3 ‘adueupJO S|yl jo ¥oE-S¥ § up pauysp se Suip _:n uu___,twn 40 uomuyap ay3 ulyHMm sjjey Ja8uoj ou KAadoad
ay3 saujw.alap wswiedaq ay3 ‘uolidadsul Jaiye 4 “Aouednado o3 sord Jnddo 03 Auadouad ayz yo uoidadsu)

9o 9 o3ed

UO[RAISOI] POOYIOqUSIeN I ‘woidurwoold Jo AND

020T/ST/1 T86LIPYE/IOd'09€apoasy/:sdny

104 98ue.te pue snieds u) a8ueLD auj1 1s8nbas 01 JapJo U] JuswdopAs AUUNWILOD JO JuUBlLIEda BU3 10RIUOI [[BYS
Aysadoud pres 4oy 3usde Jo seumo ayp ‘A13siSas Bulp|ing 1[a.0p 8Y3 WoJj Bulp(iNg © JO [BAGWISJ UJRIGO OF JBPIO U]

[96-L10z "oN "p10]
*sniels Suipjing 301[48p Jo [eAoway [ zL-ooLL *dags GF "ys] e1e-5h §

*sasiwatd ay3 03 9j3n Suginboe jo skep OF uYIM SIBUMO MBU B2 JO JBqUINU duoydajsy
pue ssaappe ‘eweu sy Addns pue juswdojaasg Ayunwwo) jo uswiledad sy YHMm uoileslsiSal mau e a]ly 03
padinbau sj ueumo mau syl “diysssumo uf sBueyd e SupueisyumIoy 398448 uj ufewa. [feys uejd Suip)ing 1(pIep YL

[96-Li0% 'ON "pIO]
-diysaaumo jo aduey) [ L1'oolL 095 ‘G¥ 'yp] Le-Sv §

[96-L10Z *ON *PI0O]

‘BuIp|INg 101243p E JO SOUBUSIURLY pUE

uoije.nsi3ad Y3 yIm PaIBDOSSE SISO U Sauy ‘seay predun Joy pazedo) s Suip|ing 101j8.13p  yojym uo fAuedold

342 UO UB)[ B 3]} OS[e Aew A1) 3U 1 “SSUIP(ING 1D1[2J9P 0 SIUEUSIUIRL PUE UOPRASISL BUL UM POTRIDOSSE
$1505 pUE s3Uy} ‘54 predun 12A0031 03 AUN0Y UESTOW 40 12007 1D BU Uy 3 Aew UoIBUIWCO|E 40 A1 3yl -4

*55Ua40 21es2das B PaWasp aq OS[e {[BYS S3NUIU0D UOjIE|oA Aue Aep ydeg
'35UB}0 BreseddS © PaLEp 94 ([eys uoIR|OIA Yo “Aep Jad 00S¢ 03 0S¢ Jo auy e 03 A1ied s|qisuodsal ayio
10 3uafe Jaumo a3 3[gns |[eys adueUIPIQ SIYI JO LOE-GF § Jo sjuswalnba. sy jo Aue yum Aldwod o3 aunjed 3

me] Aq papiaoJd sanfeuad to sauy ‘seey Jaylo
Auz 03 uojippe U} Aep Jad 005¢ 03 0S¢ WO JO BUY B 01 JSUMO 343 192(qNS [[BYS PUE 3]D[1.IE S[U3 JO UOHE[OIA
B 9INISUOD ||BUS ‘MB|ADY JO pieog adueuaiuely Aadold syl Ag payipow Jo Juswdolaasg AHUNWWIoD
40 10309410 ay3 Aq paac.adde se ue|d Suip)ing 101j849p BY3 Jo suswalnbat ay3 yum A|dwod o3 ainped  °q

“SPELU JUSLSIRIS BS[B} DB 10§ 000°LS LR} SI0W J0U 0SZ¢ ueys
SS9} 10U JO BUJ} B 01 303[qNS 3q JeYS JUSWAIEIS uone.lIs[SaL B UO UoIRWIIOHU| BS[e) sapiaold oym uosiad Auy D

‘mef Aq papold sapeusd
10 sauly 5994 18Y30 Aue 03 LoIppe Ul Aep Jad 00SE 03 0S¢ 4O BULL B YIIM UOIIR|OIA BOUBUIPJO LR S 3)qeysiund
94 j|eys 9duRUIPIO SiY3 Aq paJinba. se uopedyou 4o sAep oL ujyum Suipjing 10(a4ap e Ja3si8ad o) aunjiey g

“ulR4aY papiaoad se sapieusd 03 J0IRI0IA SY3
Pa[qns [[eys pue dsUO AN[Iqe]| 32143S B PAWABP Bq |[BYS 3IUBLIPIO SIYI JO SUOISIACLD BYT JO AUe JO UOIBIOIA Y

*salljeudd [ oL'ooll -39s ‘G "y olE-Sv §

[96-L107 *oN *p40O]

‘uerd Suipjing

12][243p B3 BINHISUOD PUR [eUY 3] |[BYS PJBOY MBIABY 3DUBUSIUEI Aadold BY2 JO UOISIDRP BU L "10323Ji]

a2 Ag psniwqns uejd pajyipous ayl 1o Jaumo ay3 Aq parywigns ue|d ay3 sacsdde Jo uryd Su q )eJdep

UMO S} UOjysey 03 AJJOYINE B3 3ARY |[RYS PIBOg MBIASY IduRUSIUERN Aliedoud ayL -uejd Suipiing dyeiep

a3 o suojzeoyipow pasodoad sustudoPABg AUNWIWOD) JO J0ID8.I 341 Jo [eadde s, Jaumo ay3 UO UOISIIBP S
Japual |leys ‘paauasaid souspias pue Auowse sy Suliapisuod Jaye ‘pieog MaIARY adueusiuRW Auadoid syl D

“urio} uopre.siBal Suipjing
3U3 UO SS2UPPE 5,.19UMO SY3 Se palst) ssappe Ue 0] pajfetu usaq Sujaey so3ye sAep Jnoy PaAladal paLsap aq [[Bys
8130U 3y | *[BIUSP 1O UOREIYIPOW 4O 93130U 54030341 843 40 3d[203J JO 31ep U2 Jo skep SL ujyym Juswdoaaaq
Ajunwwio? Jo 10393J1a 243 YuM pajly 8q ||eys feadde yons ‘v60E-5¥ § Ul Y3404 39S SPIEPURIS BYI YHM
32UBPIOID. Ul UOBUIULISISP [eUL; JO) Pieog MY sdueusiulel Aladoud uoiBujwoolg jo AuD a3 o3 [eadde

930 ¢9a8ed : uoleAIeSaId pooyIoquSieN I ‘uoidurmoold Jo A1)





